
Bid #: 2025-01 
Bid Item: Aggregate Materials - Seasonal
Bid Opening Date: Tuesday, January 28 2025 at 10:00 am
Bid Award Date: Tuesday, February 11, 2025

Contract Term:

Bidders Material Location Unit Price

Top Grade Aggregates, LLC. 1100 Nazareth Rd. Kalamazoo, MI 49408 $36.00
Rison Transport LLC No bid
Aggregate Resourses, Inc 4724 Ravine Rd, Kalamazoo MI $20.35
High Grade Materials 269 M-89, Plainwell, MI 49080 $22.00
NRK Contracting
USA EARTHWORKS No bid

Top Grade Aggregates, LLC. No bid
Rison Transport LLC No bid
Aggregate Resourses, Inc 8964 Paw Paw Lk Dr. Kalamazoo MI $24.50
High Grade Materials No bid
NRK Contracting
USA EARTHWORKS No bid

Top Grade Aggregates, LLC. No bid
Rison Transport LLC No bid
Aggregate Resourses, Inc 4724 Ravine Rd, Kalamazoo MI $22.50
High Grade Materials No bid
NRK Contracting
USA EARTHWORKS No bid

Top Grade Aggregates, LLC. 1100 Nazareth Rd. Kalamazoo, MI 49408 $16.00
Rison Transport LLC No bid
Aggregate Resourses, Inc 4724 Ravine Rd, Kalamazoo MI $10.05
High Grade Materials 269 M-89, Plainwell, MI 49080 $9.25
NRK Contracting
USA EARTHWORKS No bid

Top Grade Aggregates, LLC. No bid
Rison Transport LLC No bid
Aggregate Resourses, Inc 4724 Ravine Rd, Kalamazoo MI $13.05
High Grade Materials 269 M-89, Plainwell, MI 49080 $9.25
NRK Contracting
USA EARTHWORKS No bid

Top Grade Aggregates, LLC. No bid
Rison Transport LLC No bid
Aggregate Resourses, Inc No bid
High Grade Materials No bid
NRK Contracting
USA EARTHWORKS No bid

Top Grade Aggregates, LLC. No bid
Rison Transport LLC No bid
Aggregate Resourses, Inc No bid
High Grade Materials No bid
NRK Contracting

LOADED PRICE RCKC TRUCK AT VENDOR LOCATION

Prices to remain firm through 02/28/2026 
with the option of three (3) - one (1) year 
extensions 

22A Limestone Gravel - Per Ton

23A Limestone Gravel - Per Ton

6A Washed Stone - Per Ton

9A Washed Stone - Per Ton

21AA Stabilized Gravel - Per Ton

22A Stabilized Gravel - Per Ton

23A Stabilized Gravel - Per Ton



USA EARTHWORKS No bid

Top Grade Aggregates, LLC. 1100 Nazareth Rd. Kalamazoo, MI 49408 $19.00
Rison Transport LLC No bid
Aggregate Resourses, Inc No bid
High Grade Materials 269 M-89, Plainwell, MI 49080 $22.00
NRK Contracting
USA EARTHWORKS No bid

Top Grade Aggregates, LLC. No bid
Rison Transport LLC No bid
Aggregate Resourses, Inc No bid
High Grade Materials No bid
NRK Contracting
USA EARTHWORKS No bid

Top Grade Aggregates, LLC. No bid
Rison Transport LLC No bid
Aggregate Resourses, Inc No bid
High Grade Materials No bid
NRK Contracting
USA EARTHWORKS No bid

Top Grade Aggregates, LLC. No bid
Rison Transport LLC No bid
Aggregate Resourses, Inc No bid
High Grade Materials No bid
NRK Contracting
USA EARTHWORKS No bid

Top Grade Aggregates, LLC. No bid
Rison Transport LLC No bid
Aggregate Resourses, Inc No bid
High Grade Materials No bid
NRK Contracting
USA EARTHWORKS No bid

Top Grade Aggregates, LLC. No bid
Rison Transport LLC No bid
Aggregate Resourses, Inc 15830 E Michigan Ave. Kalamazoo MI $46.30
High Grade Materials No bid
NRK Contracting
USA EARTHWORKS No bid

Top Grade Aggregates, LLC. No bid
Rison Transport LLC No bid
Aggregate Resourses, Inc No bid
High Grade Materials No bid
NRK Contracting
USA EARTHWORKS No bid

Top Grade Aggregates, LLC. No bid
Rison Transport LLC No bid
Aggregate Resourses, Inc No bid
High Grade Materials No bid
NRK Contracting
USA EARTHWORKS No bid

Top Grade Aggregates, LLC. No bid
Rison Transport LLC No bid
Aggregate Resourses, Inc No bid

3”-5” Limestone - Per Ton

3”- 5” Stone - Per Ton

6” - 8 “ Stone - Per Ton

8” and larger Stone - Per Ton

Ohio #9 Limestone - washed - Per Ton

 H1 Limestone – washed - Per Ton

21AA Crushed Concrete - Per Ton

22A Crushed Concrete - Per Ton

2”- 3” Stone - Per Ton



High Grade Materials No bid
NRK Contracting
USA EARTHWORKS No bid

Top Grade Aggregates, LLC. No bid
Rison Transport LLC No bid
Aggregate Resourses, Inc No bid
High Grade Materials No bid
NRK Contracting
USA EARTHWORKS No bid

Top Grade Aggregates, LLC. No bid
Rison Transport LLC No bid
Aggregate Resourses, Inc No bid
High Grade Materials No bid
NRK Contracting
USA EARTHWORKS No bid

Top Grade Aggregates, LLC. No bid
Rison Transport LLC No bid
Aggregate Resourses, Inc No bid
High Grade Materials No bid
NRK Contracting
USA EARTHWORKS No bid

Top Grade Aggregates, LLC. No bid
Rison Transport LLC No bid
Aggregate Resourses, Inc No bid
High Grade Materials No bid
NRK Contracting
USA EARTHWORKS No bid

Top Grade Aggregates, LLC. 1100 Nazareth Rd. Kalamazoo, MI 49408 $5.00
Rison Transport LLC No bid
Aggregate Resourses, Inc 4724 Ravine Rd, Kalamazoo MI $4.85
High Grade Materials 269 M-89, Plainwell, MI 49080 $4.00
NRK Contracting
USA EARTHWORKS No bid

Top Grade Aggregates, LLC. 1100 Nazareth Rd. Kalamazoo, MI 49408 $14.00
Rison Transport LLC No bid
Aggregate Resourses, Inc No bid
High Grade Materials No bid
NRK Contracting
USA EARTHWORKS No bid

Top Grade Aggregates, LLC. 1100 Nazareth Rd. Kalamazoo, MI 49408 $16.00
Rison Transport LLC No bid
Aggregate Resourses, Inc 2425 Kings Hwy, Kalamazoo MI $20.80
High Grade Materials No bid
NRK Contracting
USA EARTHWORKS No bid

Top Grade Aggregates, LLC. 1100 Nazareth Rd. Kalamazoo, MI 49408 $12.00
Rison Transport LLC No bid
Aggregate Resourses, Inc 2425 Kings Hwy, Kalamazoo MI $17.35
High Grade Materials No bid
NRK Contracting
USA EARTHWORKS No bid

Top Grade Aggregates, LLC. No bid

Type II Unwashed Sand - Per Ton

Asphalt Millings - Per Ton

Processed Topsoil - Per Ton

Unprocessed Topsoil - Per Ton

9A Aggregate - Per Ton

6”-8” Limestone - Per Ton

8” and larger Limestone - Per Ton

Concrete Rip/Rap - Per Ton

Limestone Rip/Rap - Per Ton



Rison Transport LLC No bid
Aggregate Resourses, Inc 8964 Paw Paw Lk Dr. Kalamazoo MI $24.50
High Grade Materials No bid
NRK Contracting
USA EARTHWORKS No bid

Top Grade Aggregates, LLC. No bid
Rison Transport LLC No bid
Aggregate Resourses, Inc 4724 Ravine Rd, Kalamazoo MI $15.10
High Grade Materials 269 M-89, Plainwell, MI 49080 $13.00
NRK Contracting
USA EARTHWORKS No bid

Birds Eye Gravel - Per Ton



DELIVERED TO RCKC FACILITY
Bidders Unit Price

Top Grade Aggregates, LLC. $37.60
Rison Transport LLC $38.00
Aggregate Resourses, Inc $23.89
High Grade Materials $27.60
NRK Contracting
USA EARTHWORKS $22.00

Top Grade Aggregates, LLC. $42.95
Rison Transport LLC
Aggregate Resourses, Inc $29.28
High Grade Materials No bid
NRK Contracting
USA EARTHWORKS No bid

Top Grade Aggregates, LLC. $37.50
Rison Transport LLC $30.00
Aggregate Resourses, Inc $26.04
High Grade Materials No bid
NRK Contracting
USA EARTHWORKS $24.00

Top Grade Aggregates, LLC. $23.15
Rison Transport LLC $22.00
Aggregate Resourses, Inc $13.59
High Grade Materials $14.85
NRK Contracting
USA EARTHWORKS $13.50

Top Grade Aggregates, LLC. $24.80
Rison Transport LLC $22.00
Aggregate Resourses, Inc $16.59
High Grade Materials $14.85
NRK Contracting
USA EARTHWORKS $14.50

Top Grade Aggregates, LLC. No bid
Rison Transport LLC $32.00
Aggregate Resourses, Inc No bid
High Grade Materials No bid
NRK Contracting
USA EARTHWORKS No bid

Top Grade Aggregates, LLC. No bid

22A Limestone Gravel - Per Ton

23A Limestone Gravel - Per Ton

6A Washed Stone - Per Ton

9A Washed Stone - Per Ton

21AA Stabilized Gravel - Per Ton

22A Stabilized Gravel - Per Ton

23A Stabilized Gravel - Per Ton



Rison Transport LLC $32.00
Aggregate Resourses, Inc No bid
High Grade Materials No bid
NRK Contracting
USA EARTHWORKS No bid

Top Grade Aggregates, LLC. $27.65
Rison Transport LLC $29.00
Aggregate Resourses, Inc No bid
High Grade Materials $27.60
NRK Contracting
USA EARTHWORKS $19.00

Top Grade Aggregates, LLC. No bid
Rison Transport LLC
Aggregate Resourses, Inc No bid
High Grade Materials No bid
NRK Contracting
USA EARTHWORKS No bid

Top Grade Aggregates, LLC. No bid
Rison Transport LLC
Aggregate Resourses, Inc No bid
High Grade Materials No bid
NRK Contracting
USA EARTHWORKS No bid

Top Grade Aggregates, LLC. No bid
Rison Transport LLC
Aggregate Resourses, Inc No bid
High Grade Materials No bid
NRK Contracting
USA EARTHWORKS No bid

Top Grade Aggregates, LLC. No bid
Rison Transport LLC
Aggregate Resourses, Inc No bid
High Grade Materials No bid
NRK Contracting $65.00
USA EARTHWORKS No bid

Top Grade Aggregates, LLC. $120.00
Rison Transport LLC
Aggregate Resourses, Inc No bid
High Grade Materials No bid
NRK Contracting $95.00
USA EARTHWORKS No bid

21AA Crushed Concrete - Per Ton

22A Crushed Concrete - Per Ton

2”- 3” Stone - Per Ton

3”- 5” Stone - Per Ton

6” - 8 “ Stone - Per Ton

8” and larger Stone - Per Ton



Top Grade Aggregates, LLC. No bid
Rison Transport LLC $40.00
Aggregate Resourses, Inc No bid
High Grade Materials No bid
NRK Contracting
USA EARTHWORKS No bid

Top Grade Aggregates, LLC. No bid
Rison Transport LLC
Aggregate Resourses, Inc No bid
High Grade Materials No bid
NRK Contracting
USA EARTHWORKS No bid

Top Grade Aggregates, LLC. No bid
Rison Transport LLC
Aggregate Resourses, Inc No bid
High Grade Materials No bid
NRK Contracting
USA EARTHWORKS No bid

Top Grade Aggregates, LLC. No bid
Rison Transport LLC
Aggregate Resourses, Inc No bid
High Grade Materials No bid
NRK Contracting
USA EARTHWORKS No bid

Top Grade Aggregates, LLC. $120.00
Rison Transport LLC $100.00
Aggregate Resourses, Inc No bid
High Grade Materials No bid
NRK Contracting
USA EARTHWORKS No bid

Top Grade Aggregates, LLC. No bid
Rison Transport LLC
Aggregate Resourses, Inc No bid
High Grade Materials No bid
NRK Contracting
USA EARTHWORKS No bid

Top Grade Aggregates, LLC. $120.00
Rison Transport LLC $42.00
Aggregate Resourses, Inc No bid
High Grade Materials No bid

3”-5” Limestone - Per Ton

6”-8” Limestone - Per Ton

8” and larger Limestone - Per Ton

Concrete Rip/Rap - Per Ton

Limestone Rip/Rap - Per Ton

 H1 Limestone – washed - Per Ton

Ohio #9 Limestone - washed - Per Ton



NRK Contracting
USA EARTHWORKS No bid

Top Grade Aggregates, LLC. $13.60
Rison Transport LLC
Aggregate Resourses, Inc No bid
High Grade Materials $9.60
NRK Contracting $8.15
USA EARTHWORKS $9.00

Top Grade Aggregates, LLC. $22.60
Rison Transport LLC $20.00
Aggregate Resourses, Inc No bid
High Grade Materials No bid
NRK Contracting
USA EARTHWORKS $19.00

Top Grade Aggregates, LLC. $24.60
Rison Transport LLC $20.00
Aggregate Resourses, Inc $24.08
High Grade Materials No bid
NRK Contracting $22.00
USA EARTHWORKS $20.00

Top Grade Aggregates, LLC. $20.60
Rison Transport LLC $15.00
Aggregate Resourses, Inc $20.63
High Grade Materials No bid
NRK Contracting $16.00
USA EARTHWORKS $15.00

Top Grade Aggregates, LLC. No bid
Rison Transport LLC
Aggregate Resourses, Inc $29.28
High Grade Materials No bid
NRK Contracting
USA EARTHWORKS No bid

Top Grade Aggregates, LLC. No bid
Rison Transport LLC
Aggregate Resourses, Inc $18.63
High Grade Materials $18.60
NRK Contracting
USA EARTHWORKS No bid

Birds Eye Gravel - Per Ton

Type II Unwashed Sand - Per Ton

Asphalt Millings - Per Ton

Processed Topsoil - Per Ton

Unprocessed Topsoil - Per Ton

9A Aggregate - Per Ton



Bid #: 2025-02
Bid Item: Hot Mix Asphalt (HMA) Patching
Bid Opening DateTuesday, January 28 2025 at 10:30 am
Bid Award Date: Tuesday, February 11, 2025

Contract Term:
A1 Asphalt 

Inc
Lakeland Asphalt 

Corporation
Item Quantity Price Price

Alamo
36A HMA  - Ton 1.00 $300.00 $210.00
23A Gravel - Ton 1.00 $70.00 $65.00
Excavation - SYD 1.00 $30.00 $25.00
Brady
36A HMA  - Ton 1.00 $300.00 $210.00
23A Gravel - Ton 1.00 $70.00 $65.00
Excavation - SYD 1.00 $30.00 $25.00
Charleston
36A HMA  - Ton 1.00 $300.00 $210.00
23A Gravel - Ton 1.00 $70.00 $65.00
Excavation - SYD 1.00 $30.00 $25.00
Climax
36A HMA  - Ton 1.00 $300.00 $210.00
23A Gravel - Ton 1.00 $70.00 $65.00
Excavation - SYD 1.00 $30.00 $25.00
Comstock
36A HMA  - Ton 1.00 $300.00 $210.00
23A Gravel - Ton 1.00 $70.00 $65.00
Excavation - SYD 1.00 $30.00 $25.00
Cooper
36A HMA  - Ton 1.00 $300.00 $210.00
23A Gravel - Ton 1.00 $70.00 $65.00
Excavation - SYD 1.00 $30.00 $25.00
Kalamazoo
36A HMA  - Ton 1.00 $300.00 $210.00
23A Gravel - Ton 1.00 $70.00 $65.00
Excavation - SYD 1.00 $30.00 $25.00
Oshtemo
36A HMA  - Ton 1.00 $300.00 $210.00
23A Gravel - Ton 1.00 $70.00 $65.00
Excavation - SYD 1.00 $30.00 $25.00
Pavilion
36A HMA  - Ton 1.00 $300.00 $210.00
23A Gravel - Ton 1.00 $70.00 $65.00
Excavation - SYD 1.00 $30.00 $25.00
Prairie Ronde

Prices to remain firm through 
12/31/2025 with the option of three (3) - 
 one (1) year extensions 



36A HMA  - Ton 1.00 $300.00 $210.00
23A Gravel - Ton 1.00 $70.00 $65.00
Excavation - SYD 1.00 $30.00 $25.00
Richland
36A HMA  - Ton 1.00 $300.00 $210.00
23A Gravel - Ton 1.00 $70.00 $65.00
Excavation - SYD 1.00 $30.00 $25.00
Ross
36A HMA  - Ton 1.00 $300.00 $210.00
23A Gravel - Ton 1.00 $70.00 $65.00
Excavation - SYD 1.00 $30.00 $25.00
Schoolcraft
36A HMA  - Ton 1.00 $300.00 $210.00
23A Gravel - Ton 1.00 $70.00 $65.00
Excavation - SYD 1.00 $30.00 $25.00
Texas
36A HMA  - Ton 1.00 $300.00 $210.00
23A Gravel - Ton 1.00 $70.00 $65.00
Excavation - SYD 1.00 $30.00 $25.00
Wakeshma
36A HMA  - Ton 1.00 $300.00 $210.00
23A Gravel - Ton 1.00 $70.00 $65.00
Excavation - SYD 1.00 $30.00 $25.00



BID TABULATION

Bid #: 2025-03
Bid Item: Dust Control

Bid Opening Date: Tuesday,  February 11, 2025 at 10:00 am
Bid Award Date: 2/25/2025

Contract Term:
S&M Liquid Tire 

Fill Inc.
Great 
Lakes 

Chloride
, Inc

Corrigan 
Oil 

Company

Item Price Price Price
Placed on a continuous basis to road surface No Bid No Bid No Bid
Calcium Chloride Liquid, 38% Cacl2 - Gallon No bid $0.96200 No Bid
Calcium Chloride Liquid, 42% Cacl2 - Gallon No Bid $1.02800 No Bid
Mineral Well Brine, 18% CaCl2 - minimum - Gallon $0.17000 No Bid $0.18500

Prices are to remain firm 
through December 31, 2025,  
with option for three(3) - one(1) 
year extensions



Bid Number: 2025-04
Bid Item: PAVEMENT LINE STRIPING & SPECIALTY PAVEMENT MARKING

Bid Opening Date: Tuesday, February 11, 2025 at 10:00 am
Bid Award Date: March 11, 2025

Contract Term:

Item Quantity Price Extension Price Extension Price Extension
Waterborne Line Striping
4" White - Feet 3,141,827 $0.06 $188,509.62 $0.06 $188,509.62 $0.10 $314,182.70
4" Yellow - Feet 2,557,294 $0.06 $153,437.64 $0.06 $153,437.64 $0.10 $255,729.40
Spray Thermoplastic Line Striping
4" White - Feet 30,000 $0.01 $300.00 $0.55 $16,500.00
4" Yellow - Feet 15,000 $0.01 $150.00 $0.55 $8,250.00
Regular Dry Line Striping
4" White - Feet 5,000 $0.08 $400.00 $0.35 $1,750.00
4" Yellow - Feet 2,500 $0.08 $200.00 $0.35 $875.00
Layout, Removal and Mobilization
Zoning - Mile 35 $20.00 $700.00 $10.00 $350.00 $500.00 $17,500.00
Remove pavement marking longitude 6" or less width - L.F. 5,000 $0.50 $2,500.00 $0.10 $500.00 $0.90 $4,500.00
Removal of special markings - Each 5 $100.00 $500.00 $5.00 $25.00 $150.00 $750.00
Mobilization Fee - Each 10 $250.00 $2,500.00 $250.00 $2,500.00 $950.00 $9,500.00
Specialty Markings/Legend Markings
24" Stop Bar, White - Feet 8,500 $2.00 $17,000.00 $2.50 $21,250.00 $5.70 $48,450.00
12" Cross Walk, White - Feet 16,000 $1.50 $24,000.00 $2.00 $32,000.00 $3.00 $48,000.00
Continental Cross Walk, White - Feet 2,500 $1.50 $3,750.00 $2.75 $6,875.00 $4.00 $10,000.00
8' "ONLY" Legend, White - Each 300 $49.00 $14,700.00 $60.00 $18,000.00 $100.00 $30,000.00
Straight Arrow, White - Each 5 $45.00 $225.00 $55.00 $275.00 $90.00 $450.00
Right Arrow, White - Each 140 $49.00 $6,860.00 $50.00 $7,000.00 $98.00 $13,720.00
Left Arrow, White - Each 450 $49.00 $22,050.00 $50.00 $22,500.00 $98.00 $44,100.00
Straight Left Arrow, White - Each 5 $70.00 $350.00 $80.00 $400.00 $110.00 $550.00
Straight Right Arrow, \White - Each 5 $70.00 $350.00 $80.00 $400.00 $110.00 $550.00
Railroad Crossing Symbol Including 24" Bands, White - Each 75 $125.00 $9,375.00 $125.00 $9,375.00 $315.00 $23,625.00
"SCHOOL" Legend, White - Each 50 $100.00 $5,000.00 $75.00 $3,750.00 $110.00 $5,500.00
"STOP" Legend, White - Each 1 $100.00 $100.00 $55.00 $55.00 $110.00 $110.00
"AHEAD" Legend, White - Each 1 $100.00 $100.00 $55.00 $55.00 $115.00 $115.00
"SLOW" Legend, White - Each 4 $100.00 $400.00 $55.00 $220.00 $110.00 $440.00
Merge Arrow Markings - Each 4 $250.00 $1,000.00 $75.00 $300.00 $165.00 $660.00
12" Crosshatch, White - Feet 1,000 $1.50 $1,500.00 $2.00 $2,000.00 $3.00 $3,000.00
12" Crosshatch, Yellow - Feet 600 $1.50 $900.00 $2.00 $1,200.00 $3.00 $1,800.00

27 Items Totals $456,857.26 $470,977.26 $860,607.10

Through 12/31/2025, with the option to extend 
for three (3) one (1) year extensions by mutual 
agreement

Michigan Pavement 
Markings LLC

M & M Pavement 
Marking, Inc.

P.K. Contracting, 
Inc.



Bid #: 2025-05

Bid Item:

Bid Opening Date: Tuesday,February 25, 2025 at 10:00 am

Bid Award Date: Tuesday, March 11, 2025
Contract Term:

BID TABULATION

Quick Mow Inc J. Jablonski 
and Sons Inc

Item Price Price
Area 1, Specification #1  6FT Two times a year
Alamo (approx 68 miles) - 2 $5,290.40 $6,783.68
Cooper (approx 71 miles) - 2 $5,523.80 $7,082.96
Kalamazoo (approx 18 miles) - 2 $1,400.40 $1,795.68
Oshtemo (approx 73 miles) - 2 $5,679.40 $7,282.48
Richland (approx 69 miles) - 2 $5,368.20 $6,883.44
Area 1, Specification #2  15FT once a year
Alamo (approx 68 miles) - 1 $6,626.60 $6,789.12
Cooper (approx 71 miles) - 1 $6,918.95 $7,088.64
Kalamazoo (approx 18 miles) - 1 $1,754.10 $1,797.12
Oshtemo (approx 73 miles) - 1 $7,113.85 $7,288.32
Richland (approx 69 miles) - 1 $6,724.05 $6,888.96
Area 2, Specification #1  6FT Two times a year
Ross (approx 69 miles) - 2 $5,368.20 $6,883.44
Charleston (approx 44 miles) - 2 $3,423.20 $4,389.44
Comstock (approx 70 miles) - 2 $5,446.00 $6,983.20
Pavilion (approx 68 miles) - 2 $5,290.40 $6,783.68
Climax (approx 72 miles) - 2 $5,601.60 $7,182.72
Area 2, Specification #2  15FT once a year
Ross (approx 69 miles) - 1 $6,724.05 $6,888.96
Charleston (approx 44 miles) - 1 $4,287.80 $4,392.96
Comstock (approx 70 miles) - 1 $6,821.50 $6,988.80
Pavilion (approx 68 miles) - 1 $6,626.60 $6,789.12
Climax (approx 72 miles) - 1 $6,626.60 $7,188.48
Area 3, Specification #1  6FT Two times a year
Wakeshma (approx 72 miles) - 2 $5,601.60 $7,182.72
Brady (approx 73 miles) - 2 $5,679.40 $7,282.48
Schoolcraft (approx 53 miles) - 2 $4,123.40 $5,287.28
Prairie Ronde (approx 69 miles) - 2 $5,368.20 $6,883.44
Texas (approx 67 miles) - 2 $2,606.30 $6,683.92
Area 3, Specification #2  15FT once a year
Wakeshma (approx 72 miles) - 1 $7,016.40 $7,188.48
Brady (approx 73 miles) - 1 $7,113.85 $7,288.32
Schoolcraft (approx 53 miles) - 1 $5,164.85 $5,291.52
Prairie Ronde (approx 69 miles) - 1 $6,724.05 $6,888.96
Texas (approx 67 miles)  - 1 $6,529.15 $6,689.28
Other, Specification #2, 15FT Three Times a Year
Shaver Road (approx 0.5 miles) - 3 $1,979.99 $360.00
Sprinkle Rd - G Avenue to I-94 BL (approx 5 miles) - 3 $1,979.99 $3,000.00

32 Items $168,502.88 $194,177.60

2025 Season; Option for three (3) - 
one (1)  year extensions 

Roadside Mowing Services & 
Additional Width Mowing



Bid Number: 2025-06
Bid Item: Culvert Materials Corrugated Steel Pipe (CSP)

Bid Opening Date: Tuesday, February 25, 2025 at 10:00 am
Bid Award Date:

Contract Term:

Item Quanity Price Extension Price Extension Price Extension
Culvert
12"x30' 16 gauge - 150 150 $204.00 $30,600.00 $204.00 $30,600.00 $231.60 $34,740.00
18"x50' 16 gauge - 25 25 $500.00 $12,500.00 $514.00 $12,850.00 $481.50 $12,037.50
24"x50' 16 gauge - 6 6 $700.00 $4,200.00 $655.00 $3,930.00 $765.00 $4,590.00
Culvert Ends
12" - 300 300 $45.00 $13,500.00 $52.00 $15,600.00 $48.50 $14,550.00
18" - 50 50 $70.00 $3,500.00 $80.00 $4,000.00 $68.50 $3,425.00
24" - 12 12 $110.00 $1,320.00 $125.00 $1,500.00 $115.00 $1,380.00
24" Bands
12" - 75 75 $14.00 $1,050.00 $13.70 $1,027.50 $15.76 $1,182.00
18" - 12 12 $20.00 $240.00 $20.60 $247.20 $19.66 $235.92

8 Items $66,910.00 $69,754.70 $72,140.42

Jensen Bridge and 
Supply Company

St. Regis Culvert, 
Inc.

Cadillac Culvert, Inc.

March 11, 2025
Through 12/31/2025, with the 
option to extend for three (3) one 
(1) year extensions by mutual 



Bid Number: 2025-07
Bid Item: NEW 2025- 3/4 Ton Pick up Truck

Bid Opening Date: Tuesday, February 25, 2025 at 10:00 am
Bid Award Date: March 11, 2025

Contract Term:

Item Delivery Days From 
Order

Quantity Price Extension Price Extension Price Extension

FOUR (4) NEW 2024 OR 2025 3/4 Ton Pickup Truck
FORD F250 - 2025 - FORD - F250 10-12 Weeks 4 $65,838.00 $263,352.00
2025 Ram 2500 - 2025 - Ram - 2500 60-90 days 4 $71,613.50 $286,454.00
2025 Ford F-250 Diesel Pickup  - 2025 - Ford - F-250 80 4 $68,780.00 $275,120.00

3 Items Totals $263,352.00 $275,120.00 $286,454.00

SEELYE FORD Bob Maxey Ford Vicksburg Chrysler 

One time purchase



Bid Number: 2025-08 
Bid Item: Pulverizing and Rotomiling Services

Bid Opening Date: Tuesday, March 11, 2025
Bid Award Date:

Contract Term:

BID TABULATION
Lakeland 
Asphalt 

Corporation

j.l. 
milling

Michigan 
Paving & 

Materials Co

Item Price Price Price

Pulverizing and Rotomilling Cost Per Hour 
Contractor to Haul/Retain Millings
6’6” minimum mill width - Hour $1,280.00 $730.00 $600.00
3’ minimum mill width - Hour $465.00
Skid Steer mounted 18” wide mill - Hour $400.00 $185.00 $200.00
Pulverizing without Brine - Hour $730.00
Pulverizing w/ Brine supplied by RCKC - Hour $630.00
Trenching - Hour $465.00
Pulverizing and Rotomilling Cost Per Hour 
RCKC to Haul/Retain Millings
6’6” minimum mill width - Hour $595.00 $730.00 $650.00
3’ minimum mill width - Hour $465.00
Skid Steer mounted 18” wide mill - Hour $250.00 $185.00 $200.00
Pulverizing without Brine - Hour $730.00
Pulverizing w/ Brine supplied by RCKC - Hour $630.00
Trenching - Hour $465.00

March 25, 2025
Prices to remain firm through 
12/31/2025, with the option to 
extend for three (3) one (1) year 
extensions by mutual agreement



Bid Number: 2025-09
Bid Item:  Crack Fill - Various Locations

Bid Opening Date: Tuesday, April 8, 2025
Bid Award Date:
Contract Terms:

Item Quantity Price Extension Quantity Price Extension Quantity Price Extension
ROAD PROJECTS (June 1, 2025 completion date) Pounds Pounds Pounds
Richland - C Avenue- 24th Street to 27th Street - Pound - 
1.5 960 $1.33 $1,276.80 3519 $1.58 $5,560.02 3900 $1.31 $5,109.00

Richland - DE Avenue- 1,320' west of Sprinkle Road to 
Sprinkle Road - Pound - 0.25

600 $1.33 $798.00 586 $1.58 $925.88 1000 $1.31 $1,310.00

Richland - E Avenue- Sprinkle Road to 28th Street - Pound - 
1.61

1020 $1.33 $1,356.60 3721 $1.58 $5,879.18 3950 $1.31 $5,174.50

Richland - 30th Street- D Avenue to M-343 - Pound - 1.24 1140 $1.33 $1,516.20 2932 $1.58 $4,632.56 3700 $1.31 $4,847.00

Richland - 34th Street- DE Avenue to D Avenue  - Pound - 
0.5

1020 $1.33 $1,356.60 173 $1.58 $273.34 500 $1.85 $925.00

Richland - 31st Street- G Avenue to EF Avenue  - Pound - 
1.5

3600 $1.33 $4,788.00 3519 $1.58 $5,560.02 3900 $1.31 $5,109.00

Alamo - G Avenue- Wolf Lake Drive to 2nd Street  - Pound - 
0.25

360 $1.33 $478.80 586 $1.58 $925.88 1000 $1.50 $1,500.00

Alamo - Stoney Woods Drive- Ravine Road to 2,300' east 
of Ravine Road - Pound - 0.44

1500 $1.33 $1,995.00 987 $1.58 $1,559.46 1200 $1.52 $1,824.00

Comstock - K Avenue- M96 to 33rd Street - Pound - 1.69 2700 $1.33 $3,591.00 3927 $1.58 $6,204.66 3900 $1.31 $5,109.00
Comstock - Interstate Parkway- Old Cork Street to 800' 
north of Old Cork Street - Pound - 0.15

240 $1.33 $319.20 519 $1.58 $820.02 500 $2.00 $1,000.00

Comstock - Old Cork Street- Midlink Drive to Park Circle 
Drive  - Pound - 0.39

720 $1.33 $957.60 1021 $1.58 $1,613.18 1100 $1.52 $1,672.00

Comstock - Comstock Avenue - River Street to Conrad 
Street
Abbey Street - River Street to Metzger Street 
Francis Street - River Street to Henry Street
Wright Street - Moline Street to Gateway Street
Celery Street - River Street to Roe Street
Moline Street - Celery Street to Comstock Avenue
Conrad Street - Celery Street to Comstock Avenue
Metzger Street - Celery Street to Abbey Street
Henry Street - Celery Street to Francis Street
Gateway Street - Celery Street to Wright Street - Pound - 
3.27

3500 $1.33 $4,655.00 7624 $1.58 $12,045.92 10000 $1.31 $13,100.00

Comstock - Market Street- River Street to Stalwart Street - 
Pound - 1.14

1310 $1.33 $1,742.30 2513 $1.58 $3,970.54 3000 $1.52 $4,560.00

Comstock - L Avenue- River Street to 160' east of Stalwart 
Street - Pound - 1.27

1500 $1.33 $1,995.00 3138 $1.58 $4,958.04 3500 $1.52 $5,320.00

Comstock - Stalwart Street- L Avenue to Market Street - 
Pound - 0.25

360 $1.33 $478.80 586 $1.58 $925.88 1000 $1.52 $1,520.00

Comstock - Country Meadows Drive - 28th Street to 200’ 
north of Silverton Ave,
Duncan Avenue - Country Meadows Drive to 28th Street,
Ringling Avenue - Country Meadows Drive to 28th Street,
Wild Meadow Street - Ringling Avenue to Kristin Avenue,
Prairie Hill Street - Ringling Ave to Duncan Avenue,
Flower Field Avenue - Country Meadows Drive to Prairie Hill 
Street,
Natalie Street - Wild Meadow Street to Cindy Street,
Cindy Street - Natalie Street to Kristin Avenue,
Cade Avenue - Cindy Street to 28th Street,
Little Red Avenue - 172’ west of Wild Meadow Street to Wild 
Meadow Street,
Silverton Avenue - 165’ west of Durango Street to Country 
Meadows Drive,
Durango Street - Crestwood Avenue to Silverton Avenue - 
Pound - 2.66

6700 $1.33 $8,911.00 6273 $1.58 $9,911.34 8000 $1.31 $10,480.00

Comstock - 28th Street- H Avenue to G Avenue - Pound - 
1.02

1200 $1.33 $1,596.00 2346 $1.58 $3,706.68 3100 $1.31 $4,061.00

Comstock - H Avenue- 26th Street to 28th Street - Pound - 
1.02

770 $1.33 $1,024.10 2346 $1.58 $3,706.68 3100 $1.31 $4,061.00

Prices to remain firm through 12/31/2025, with the option to extend 
for three (3) one (1) year extensions by mutual

Asphalt Restoration Inc. Buck Pavement 
Restoration, LLC Scodeller Construction Inc

April 22, 2025



Comstock - Winterburn Street - 850’ south of M-96 to M-96
Ocum Street - Gleason Street to M-96
Blalock Street - Gleason Street to M-96
Gleason Street - Ocum Street to 572’ east of Blalock Street  
- Pound - 0.6

960 $1.33 $1,276.80 152 $1.58 $240.16 500 $1.52 $760.00

Cooper - McKinley Street- 20th Street to Riverview Drive - 
Pound - 1.05

5900 $1.33 $7,847.00 2346 $1.58 $3,706.68 3100 $1.31 $4,061.00

Cooper - 22nd Street- B Avenue to Baseline Road  - Pound - 
 0.52

300 $1.33 $399.00 1271 $1.58 $2,008.18 1100 $1.52 $1,672.00

Cooper - B Avenue- 12th Street to Douglas Avenue  - 
Pound - 1.67

5000 $1.33 $6,650.00 3825 $1.58 $6,043.50 3700 $1.31 $4,847.00

Cooper - B Avenue- Douglas Avenue to 16th Street - Pound 
- 0.38

600 $1.33 $798.00 1091 $1.58 $1,723.78 1100 $1.52 $1,672.00

Cooper - B Avenue- 16th Street to 17th Street - Pound - 0.51 2000 $1.33 $2,660.00 1193 $1.58 $1,884.94 1300 $1.52 $1,976.00

Cooper - Baseline Road- Douglas Avenue to 16th Street  - 
Pound - 0.53

300 $1.33 $399.00 1206 $1.58 $1,905.48 1300 $1.52 $1,976.00

Kalamazoo - Dartmouth Street – West Main Street to 
Hillsdale Avenue
Clarendon Street – West Main Street to West North Street
Berkley Street – West Main Street to Hillsdale Avenue
Commonwealth Avenue – Dartmouth Street to Arlington 
Street
West North Street – Dartmouth Street to Berkley Street  - 
Pound - 1.34

2340 $1.33 $3,112.20 3078 $1.58 $4,863.24 3700 $1.31 $4,847.00

Kalamazoo - Cooper Avenue- Dearborn Avenue to East 
Main Street - Pound - 0.22

400 $1.33 $532.00 521 $1.58 $823.18 1000 $1.52 $1,520.00

Kalamazoo - Borgess Drive- Nazareth Road to 75' west of 
Casper Street  - Pound - 0.25

1400 $1.33 $1,862.00 586 $1.58 $925.88 1000 $1.52 $1,520.00

Oshtemo - 1st Street- 422' north of Stadium Drive to M 
Avenue  - Pound - 1.01

900 $1.33 $1,197.00 2356 $1.58 $3,722.48 3100 $1.31 $4,061.00

Oshtemo - KL Avenue- 2nd Street to 4th Street  - Pound - 
1.03

3000 $1.33 $3,990.00 2371 $1.58 $3,746.18 3100 $1.31 $4,061.00

Oshtemo - Cross Country Drive - 7th Street to 433’ north of 
Oak Highlands Drive,
Steeplechase Court - Cross Country Drive to 700’ east of 
Cross Country Drive,
Windcrest Court - Cross Country Drive to 282’ east of Cross 
Country Drive,
West Foxmoor Court - Cross Country Drive to 364’ west of 
Cross Country Drive,
East Foxmoor Court - Cross Country Drive to 366’ east of 
Cross Country Drive,
Farmwood Court - Cross Country Drive to 193’ west of 
Cross Country Drive,
Arbor Valley Drive - Cross Country Drive to 646’ east of 
Cross Country Drive,
Hawthorn Valley Drive - 164’ west of Cross Country Drive to 
336’ east of Cross Country Drive,
Oak Highlands Drive - 380’ west of Cross Country Drive to 
9th Street - Pound - 1.59

9600 $1.33 $12,768.00 3628 $1.58 $5,732.24 4500 $1.31 $5,895.00

Oshtemo - Darlington Trail -Tillingsdale Drive to Oshtemo 
Ridge Trail, 
Tillingsdale Drive - Coddington Lane to Ellington Drive
Ellington Drive - Coddington Lane to Oshtemo Ridge Trail
Oshtemo Ridge Trail - Coddington Lane to Darlington Trail,  - 
 Pound - 0.93

600 $1.33 $798.00 1943 $1.58 $3,069.94 2900 $1.31 $3,799.00

Oshtemo - 7th Street- W. Main Street to 5,280' north of W. 
Main Street - Pound - 1.0

1350 $1.33 $1,795.50 2346 $1.58 $3,706.68 3100 $1.31 $4,061.00

Oshtemo - Plainview Street- 960' south of Stadium Drive to 
Stadium Drive - Pound - 0.18

840 $1.33 $1,117.20 312 $1.58 $492.96 1000 $1.52 $1,520.00

Oshtemo - Vienna Street- Parkview Avenue to 790' north of 
Parkview Avenue  - Pound - 0.15

800 $1.33 $1,064.00 215 $1.58 $339.70 500 $1.52 $760.00

Oshtemo - Lisa Drive - Rosemary Lane to 200’ north of 
Rosemary Lane
Rosemary Lane - 503’ west of Josiane Drive to 2nd Street 
Josiane Drive - 1,170’ south of Rosemary Lane to 
Rosemary Lane - Pound - 0.49

2100 $1.33 $2,793.00 1021 $1.58 $1,613.18 1500 $1.52 $2,280.00

Oshtemo - Chadds Ford Way- 985' south of W. Main Street 
to W. Main Street - Pound - 0.19

600 $1.33 $798.00 316 $1.58 $499.28 1000 $1.52 $1,520.00

Oshtemo - Valley Industrial Drive- 9th Street to 630' east of 
9th Street - Pound - 0.12

1035 $1.33 $1,376.55 211 $1.58 $333.38 1000 $1.52 $1,520.00



Oshtemo - Wolf Drive- Van Kal Street to G Avenue  - Pound 
- 1.36

840 $1.33 $1,117.20 3212 $1.58 $5,074.96 3500 $1.31 $4,585.00

Oshtemo - ML Avenue- 4th Street to 8th Street - Pound - 
2.03

6000 $1.33 $7,980.00 692 $1.58 $7,413.36 6200 $1.31 $8,122.00

Oshtemo - H Avenue- Van Kal Street to 3rd Street - Pound - 
1.5

2700 $1.33 $3,591.00 3521 $1.58 $5,563.18 4500 $1.31 $5,895.00

Ross- 47th Street- B Avenue to Baseline Road - Pound - 
0.75

1020 $1.33 $1,356.60 1621 $1.58 $2,561.18 2500 $1.31 $3,275.00

Ross - Baseline Road- 44th Street to 47th Street - Pound - 
1.3

1500 $1.33 $1,995.00 2913 $1.58 $4,602.54 3500 $1.31 $4,585.00

Ross - 43rd Street- B Avenue to 4,171' north of B Avenue  - 
Pound - 0.79

840 $1.33 $1,117.20 1759 $1.58 $2,779.22 3200 $1.31 $4,192.00

ROAD PROJECTS (July 1, 2025 completion date) 
Brady - 31st Street- YZ Avenue to X Avenue - Pound - 1.5 9400 $1.33 $12,502.00 3519 $1.58 $5,560.02 4000 $1.31 $5,240.00

Schoolcraft - YZ Avenue- 2,640' west of US-131 to US 131 - 
Pound - 0.5

100 $1.33 $133.00 173 $1.58 $273.34 1000 $1.52 $1,520.00

Schoolcraft - YZ Avenue- US-131 to 15th Street - Pound - 
0.67

200 $1.33 $266.00 1465 $1.58 $2,314.70 1500 $1.31 $1,965.00

Schoolcraft - 18th Street- W Avenue to VW Avenue  - 
Pound - 0.51

1500 $1.33 $1,995.00 1270 $1.58 $2,006.60 1400 $1.52 $2,128.00

Schoolcraft - 18th Street- VW Avenue to U Avenue  - Pound 
- 1.46

1800 $1.33 $2,394.00 3481 $1.58 $5,499.98 4000 $1.31 $5,240.00

Schoolcraft - 16th Street- Z Avenue to VW Avenue - Pound - 
 4.01

1620 $1.33 $2,154.60 9384 $1.58 $14,826.72 12000 $1.31 $15,720.00

Pavilion - 34th Street- TS Avenue to R Avenue  - Pound - 
1.35

5900 $1.33 $7,847.00 3216 $1.58 $5,081.28 3500 $1.31 $4,585.00

Pavilion - O Avenue- 31st Street to 33rd Street - Pound - 1.0 3400 $1.33 $4,522.00 2346 $1.58 $3,706.68 3100 $1.31 $4,061.00

Pavilion - R Avenue- 32nd Street to 33rd Street - Pound - 
0.5

1400 $1.33 $1,862.00 146 $1.58 $230.68 1000 $1.52 $1,520.00

Pavilion - 33rd Street- T Avenue to S Avenue  - Pound - 0.85 3500 $1.33 $4,655.00 1921 $1.58 $3,035.18 1500 $1.52 $2,280.00

Pavilion - 31st Street- O Avenue to N Avenue  - Pound - 
0.75

3360 $1.33 $4,468.80 1759 $1.58 $2,779.22 1500 $1.52 $2,280.00

Pavilion - R Avenue-29th Street to 32nd Street - Pound - 1.5 8100 $1.33 $10,773.00 3519 $1.58 $5,560.02 3900 $1.31 $5,109.00

Pavilion - 26th Street- S Avenue to RS Avenue  - Pound - 
0.5

750 $1.33 $997.50 146 $1.58 $230.68 1500 $1.52 $2,280.00

Pavilion - RS Avenue- 25th Street to 28th Street - Pound - 
1.25

5070 $1.33 $6,743.10 2932 $1.58 $4,632.56 3500 $1.31 $4,585.00

Pavilion - 31st Street- Q Avenue to OP Avenue  - Pound - 
1.25

5940 $1.33 $7,900.20 2932 $1.58 $4,632.56 3500 $1.31 $4,585.00

Pavilion - 33rd Street- O Avenue to N Avenue  - Pound - 
0.75

1440 $1.33 $1,915.20 1759 $1.58 $2,779.22 2800 $1.31 $3,668.00

Pavilion - ON Aveune- 28th Street to 29th Street - Pound - 
0.5

2700 $1.33 $3,591.00 146 $1.58 $230.68 1000 $1.52 $1,520.00

Pavilion - O Avenue 26th Street to 28th Street/ 28th Street- 
O Avenue to ON Avenue  - Pound - 1.25

3000 $1.33 $3,990.00 2932 $1.58 $4,632.56 3100 $1.31 $4,061.00

Pavilion - O Avenue - 25th Street to 26th Street - Pound - 
0.75

3600 $1.33 $4,788.00 1759 $1.58 $2,779.22 1400 $1.52 $2,128.00

Pavilion - O Avenue- 2,640' west of 25th Street to 25th 
Street - Pound - 0.5

2300 $1.33 $3,059.00 173 $1.58 $273.34 1000 $1.52 $1,520.00

Pavilion - T Avenue- 32nd Street to 34th Street - Pound - 1.0 4500 $1.33 $5,985.00 2346 $1.58 $3,706.68 3000 $1.31 $3,930.00

Prairie Ronde - VW Avenue- 8th Street to 12th Street - 
Pound - 2.0

10800 $1.33 $14,364.00 4692 $1.58 $7,413.36 6200 $1.31 $8,122.00

Prairie Ronde - 4th Street- XY Avenue to W Avenue - 
Pound - 1.55

960 $1.33 $1,276.80 3563 $1.58 $5,629.54 4000 $1.31 $5,240.00

Texas - 6th Street (South Crooked Lake Drive)- Q Avenue 
to 742' north of Q Avenue - Pound - 0.14

480 $1.33 $638.40 438 $1.58 $692.04 1000 $1.52 $1,520.00

Texas - Vineyard Parkway- 720' south of Q Avenue to Q 
Avenue  - Pound - 0.16

840 $1.33 $1,117.20 506 $1.58 $799.48 1000 $1.52 $1,520.00

Texas - 2nd Street- S Avenue to RS Avenue - Pound - 0.5 400 $1.33 $532.00 146 $1.58 $230.68 1000 $1.52 $1,520.00

Texas - 7th Street - Q Avenue to East Crooked Lake Drive,
Crooked Lake Drive East - 800' west of 7th Street to 7th 
Street,
East Crooked Lake Drive - 7th Street to 2,573' north of 7th 
Street - Pound - 0.78

2900 $1.33 $3,857.00 1772 $1.58 $2,799.76 1500 $1.52 $2,280.00

Texas - DNR Street- 1,050' south of OP Avenue to OP 
Avenue - Pound - 0.2

600 $1.33 $798.00 72 $1.58 $113.76 1000 $1.52 $1,520.00

Texas - 10th Street- R Avenue to Q Avenue  - Pound - 1.01 3300 $1.33 $4,389.00 2352 $1.58 $3,716.16 3100 $1.31 $4,061.00



Texas - PQ Avenue- 7,920' west of 3rd Street to 3rd Street - 
Pound - 1.5

2700 $1.33 $3,591.00 3519 $1.58 $5,560.02 3900 $1.31 $5,109.00

Texas - Glenwynd Drive- 6th Street to O Avenue  - Pound - 
0.52

3150 $1.33 $4,189.50 1271 $1.58 $2,008.18 1500 $1.52 $2,280.00

Texas - RS Avenue- 2nd Street to 6th Street - Pound - 1.51 7200 $1.33 $9,576.00 3523 $1.58 $5,566.34 4500 $1.31 $5,895.00

Texas - Chadeau Avenue - Norcross Street to 10th Street,
Norcross Street - 308' south of Kieth Court to 400' North of 
Keith Court,
Keith Court - Norcross Street to 400' east of Norcross Street,
Omega Street - Chadeau Avenue to 169' north of Chadeau 
Avenue - Pound - 0.31

3111 $1.33 $4,137.63 961 $1.58 $1,518.38 1000 $1.52 $1,520.00

Texas - Treasure Island Drive - Pepper Avenue to 2,544' 
north of Pepper Avenue,                                                                                                            
                                                 Pepper Avenue - Treasure 
Island Drive to 667' east of Finnagen Street,                                                                                                                                                
                                                                                                                     
                  Woods Drive - Treasure Island Drive to 934' 
north of Treasure Island Drive,                                                                                                                                        
                                                                                       
Finnagen Street - PQ Avenue to Pepper Avenue - Pound - 

1800 $1.33 $2,394.00 2346 $1.58 $3,706.68 3200 $1.31 $4,192.00

Texas - 10th Street- Q Avenue to Texas Drive - Pound - 1.05 1500 $1.33 $1,995.00 2465 $1.58 $3,894.70 3300 $1.31 $4,323.00

Climax - 38th Street- O Avenue to 5,280' north of O Avenue  
 - Pound - 1.0

3700 $1.33 $4,921.00 2346 $1.58 $3,706.68 3200 $1.31 $4,192.00

Climax - 39th Street- T Avenue to R Avenue - Pound - 2.0 6600 $1.33 $8,778.00 4692 $1.58 $7,413.36 6200 $1.31 $8,122.00

Climax - OP Avenue- 42nd Street to 44th Street - Pound - 
1.0

1200 $1.33 $1,596.00 2346 $1.58 $3,706.68 3200 $1.31 $4,192.00

Climax - S Avenue- 43rd Street to 47th Street - Pound - 2.0 6000 $1.33 $7,980.00 4692 $1.58 $7,413.36 6200 $1.31 $8,122.00

Climax - T Avenue- 36th Street to 39th Street - Pound - 1.52 2250 $1.33 $2,992.50 3561 $1.58 $5,626.38 4500 $1.31 $5,895.00

ROAD PROJECTS (August 31, 2025 completion date) 
Comstock - Park Circle Drive-  Sprinkle Road to Old Cork 
Street - Pound - 1.0

4300 $1.33 $5,719.00 2346 $1.58 $3,706.68 3000 $1.31 $3,930.00

Comstock - Sprinkle Road - N Avenue to 275' north of Easy 
Street - Pound - 0.83

1800 $1.33 $2,394.00 2051 $1.58 $3,240.58 2900 $1.31 $3,799.00

Total Pounds 217296 187006 243850
Per Pound Bid for Additional Work:

Per Pound Bid for Additional Work - Pound 0 $1.39 $1.39 1 $1.58 $1.58 1 $1.39 $1.39
87 Items Totals $289,005.07 Totals $301,791.06 Totals $328,943.89



Bid Number: 2025-10
Bid Item: 8th Street over Sand Creek - 150’ South of Hart Drive- Culvert, Material Only and/or Remove and Installation

Bid Opening Date: Tuesday, May 6, 2025
Bid Award Date:
Contract Terms: Project

Item Quantity Price Extension Price Extension Price Extension Price Extension Price Extension Price Extension Price Extension Price Extension Price Extension
Item List 
Culv, Rem, 24 inch to 48 inch - Ea 1.00 $12,040.00 $12,040.00 $20,000.00 $20,000.00 $3,500.00 $3,500.00 $8,500.00 $8,500.00 $4,000.00 $4,000.00 $120,400.00 $120,400.00 $5,875.00 $5,875.00 $34,856.00 $34,856.00
Backfill, Structure, CIP - Cyd 500.00 $42.75 $21,375.00 $40.00 $20,000.00 $41.00 $20,500.00 $40.00 $20,000.00 $15.50 $7,750.00 $57.15 $28,575.00 $29.35 $14,675.00 $71.62 $35,810.00
Excavation, Fdn - Cyd 600.00 $55.00 $33,000.00 $28.00 $16,800.00 $12.00 $7,200.00 $100.00 $60,000.00 $11.00 $6,600.00 $40.15 $24,090.00 $24.60 $14,760.00 $52.52 $31,512.00
Erosion Control, Silt Fence - Ft 200.00 $8.00 $1,600.00 $4.50 $900.00 $25.00 $5,000.00 $25.00 $5,000.00 $10.00 $2,000.00 $4.80 $960.00 $4.50 $900.00 $3.73 $746.00
Erosion Control, Turbidity Curtain, Shallow - Ft 20.00 $20.00 $400.00 $17.50 $350.00 $100.00 $2,000.00 $500.00 $10,000.00 $100.00 $2,000.00 $77.30 $1,546.00 $36.50 $730.00 $75.60 $1,512.00
Aggregate Base, 8 inch - Syd 170.00 $62.00 $10,540.00 $35.00 $5,950.00 $18.00 $3,060.00 $30.00 $5,100.00 $23.80 $4,046.00 $27.00 $4,590.00 $16.00 $2,720.00 $62.14 $10,563.80
Aluminum Box Culvert and Wingwalls - LSUM 1.00 $81,700.00 $81,700.00 $35,533.06 $35,533.06 $84,456.00 $84,456.00 $90,800.00 $90,800.00 $35,500.00 $35,500.00 $64,801.00 $64,801.00 $88,400.00 $88,400.00 $176,225.00 $176,225.00 $82,578.00 $82,578.00
Riprap, Plain - Syd 10.00 $200.00 $2,000.00 $420.00 $4,200.00 $100.00 $1,000.00 $1,000.00 $10,000.00 $100.00 $1,000.00 $635.00 $6,350.00 $175.00 $1,750.00 $695.08 $6,950.80
Slope Restoration, Non-Freeway, Type F - Syd 150.00 $63.33 $9,499.50 $30.00 $4,500.00 $20.00 $3,000.00 $135.00 $20,250.00 $13.50 $2,025.00 $37.45 $5,617.50 $14.50 $2,175.00 $30.24 $4,536.00
Clearing - Acre 0.10 $15,000.00 $1,500.00 $25,000.00 $2,500.00 $25,000.00 $2,500.00 $100,000.00 $10,000.00 $30,000.00 $3,000.00 $125,800.00 $12,580.00 $13,500.00 $1,350.00 $59,762.17 $5,976.22

10 Items Totals $173,654.50 $35,533.06 $159,656.00 $138,560.00 $184,350.00 $97,222.00 $293,108.50 $221,160.00 $215,040.82

May 20, 2025

Vander Veen 
Excavating

E. T. MacKenzie 
Company

Hoffman Bros., Inc. Catskill Remedial 
Contracting Services, 

Inc.

Tim and Sons 
Construction, LLC

Jensen Bridge and 
Supply Company

Davis Construction, 
Inc.

SWARTHOUT 
EXCAVATING LLC

ASI Environmental 
Technologies, Inc.



Bid Number: 2025-11 
Bid Item: Rubber Modified Chip Seal

Bid Opening Date: Tuesday, May 20, 2025
Bid Award Date:

Contract Term:

Entech Inc
Item Quantity Price

All RMCS Services including Traffic Control
All RMCS Services including Traffic Control - Sq/Yrd 1.00 $4.70
INDIVIDUAL RMCS SERVICES
Stone heating/coating plant with operators - Ton 1.00 $21.40
Three (3) Distributors and operators - Hour 1.00 $975.00
Chip Spreader and Operator(s) - Hour 1.00
Roller(s) and Operator(s) - Hour 1.00
PG Asphalt Cement  - Liquid Ton 1.00 $665.23

June 3, 2025

Prices to remain firm through 
12/31/2025, with the option to extend for 
three (3) one (1) year extensions by 
mutual agreement



Bid # : 2025-12
Bid Item: Underbody Scraper - Sectional Tungsten Carbide Tipped Cutting Edges

Bid Opening Date: Tuesday, June 17, 2025 at 10:00 am
Bid Award Date:

Contract Term:

Item Quantity Price Extension Price Extension Price Extension Price Extension

Underbody Scraper-Sectional Tungsten 
Carbide Tipped Cutting Edges
270 - 4’ cutting edges 7/8” x 5” Tungsten 
carbide insert cutting edges - Feet 1,080.00 64.20 69,336.00 68.73 74,228.40 69.50 75,060.00 117.50 126,900.00

1 Items Totals
69,336.00 74,228.40 75,060.00 126,900.00

Estimated Delivery and Notes

Tuesday, July 1, 2025
Prices to remain firm through 12/31/2025, with the 
option to extend for three (3) one (1) year 

St. Regis 
Culvert, Inc.

Valk 
Manufacturing 

Compny

Wear Parts & 
Equipment Co., Inc.

10-12 weeks/ ARO 
Prices reflect 

current tariffs, any 
additional tariffs 

prior to delviery is 
the responsibility of 
Kalamazoo County 
Road Commision to 

pay

Order ships complete 
from factory 5 weeks 

after receiving an order. 
A portion of the order 

may ship sooner 
depending on instock 

availablity

45-60 Days ARO 8 weeks

BONNELL 
INDUSTRIES INC.



Bid Number: 2025-13
Bid Item: WINTER MAINTENANCE SERVICES

Bid Opening Date: September 9, 2025 10:00am
Bid Award Date:

Contract Term:

ELC Leasing 
Corporation

Apex 
Outdoor 
Solutions

Item Quantity Price Price
Contract Operator
Hourly Rate Per Operator - Hour 160.00 No Bid No Bid
Contract Operator and Equipment
Hourly Rate Per Operator & Equipment - Hour 160.00 No Bid No Bid

Contract Operator Plat - COLONY WOODS 
1" to 6" Snowfall Per Event - LSum 1.00 $2,450.00 $2,576.00
More than 6" fo snowfall Per Event - LSum 1.00 $4,850.00 $4,950.00
Contract Operator Plat - TEXAS HEIGHTS 
1" to 6" Snowfall Per Event - LSum 1.00 $2,400.00 $2,520.00
More than 6" fo snowfall Per Event - LSum 1.00 $4,800.00 $4,975.00

6 Items Totals $14,500.00 $15,021.00

Winter season of 2025-26. with option for three 
(3) - one (1) year terms

October 7, 2025



BID TABULATION
Bid Number: 2025-14

Bid Item: WINTER MAINTENANCE SERVICES
Bid Opening Date: October 14, 2025 10:00am

Bid Award Date:

Contract Term:
Apex Outdoor 

Solutions
Item Minimum Hours 

Per Operator
Number of 
Operators

Price Number of 
Operators

Price Price

Contract Operator
Hourly Rate Per Operator - Hour 160 1 $93.75 3 $95.00 No Bid
Contract Operator and Equipment
Hourly Rate Per Operator & Equipment - Hour 160 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Contract Operator Plat - WESTWOOD PLAT 
KALAMAZOO TOWNSHIP
1" to 6" Snowfall Per Event - LSum 1 No Bid No Bid $7,500.00
More than 6" fo snowfall Per Event - LSum 1 No Bid No Bid $9,750.00

West Trucking LLC K&H Tree Service 
LLC

November 4, 2025
Winter season of 2025-26. with option for three (3) - one (1) year 
terms



Bid Number: 2025-15
Bid Item: SIGN INSTALLATION AND MAINTENANCE SERVICES - COOPERATIVE BID

Bid Opening Date: Friday, December 19, 2025 at 2:00pm
Bid Award Date: Tuesday, December 30, 2025   

Contract Term: Prices to remain firm through 12/31/2026 with the option of three (3) - one (1) year extensions 

Item  Description Units City of
Kalamazoo RCKC Total

Unit Price
City of 

Kalamazoo

Road Commission 
of 

Kal. County Total Unit Price
City of 

Kalamazoo

Road Commission 
of 

Kal. County Total

Service Activity

 
200 800 1,000 $68.00 13,600.00 54,400.00 68,000.00 $115.00 23,000.00 92,000.00 115,000.00

Install Support (Flush Mount) Ea 20 1 21 $73.50 1,470.00 73.50 1,543.50 $235.00 4,700.00 235.00 4,935.00
Install Support (Stub Post) Ea 0 400 400 $165.00 0.00 66,000.00 66,000.00 $115.00 0.00 46,000.00 46,000.00
Hang Sign Ea 2,500 3,250 5,750 $9.00 22,500.00 29,250.00 51,750.00 $60.00 150,000.00 195,000.00 345,000.00
Roadsoft Data Entry Ea 0 5,000 5,000 $9.00 0.00 45,000.00 45,000.00 $20.00 0.00 100,000.00 100,000.00
Remove Sign Ea 2,300 800 3,100 $9.00 20,700.00 7,200.00 27,900.00 $30.00 69,000.00 24,000.00 93,000.00
Remove Support Ea 100 2,000 2,100 $22.50 2,250.00 45,000.00 47,250.00 $25.00 2,500.00 50,000.00 52,500.00
Remove Support (Flush Mount) Ea 20 1 21 $30.00 600.00 30.00 630.00 $30.00 600.00 30.00 630.00
Straighten Support Ea 20 10 30 $60.00 1,200.00 600.00 1,800.00 $60.00 1,200.00 600.00 1,800.00
Core Drill Ea 10 1 11 $250.00 2,500.00 250.00 2,750.00 $150.00 1,500.00 150.00 1,650.00

Subtotal - Service Activity: $64,820.00 $247,803.50 $312,623.50 $252,500.00 $508,015.00 $760,515.00

Materials

3 Lb Galvanized U-Channel Post Ft 1,300 17,600 18,900 $3.65 4,745.00 64,240.00 68,985.00 $4.75 6,175.00 83,600.00 89,775.00

2 Lb Galvanized U-Channel Post Ft 1,200 0 1,200 $2.60 3,120.00 0.00 3,120.00 $3.75 4,500.00 0.00 4,500.00

2" x 2" Square Post Ft 200 0 200 $6.50 1,300.00 0.00 1,300.00 $7.75 1,550.00 0.00 1,550.00

Flush Mount Base Ea 20 1 21 $65.00 1,300.00 65.00 1,365.00 $255.00 5,100.00 255.00 5,355.00

Aluminum HIP Standard Sign Sft 12,500 7,610 20,110 $7.30 91,250.00 55,553.00 146,803.00 $8.75 109,375.00 66,587.50 175,962.50

Aluminum HIP Special Sign Sft 150 700 850 $11.15 1,672.50 7,805.00 9,477.50 $10.25 1,537.50 7,175.00 8,712.50

Aluminum Diamond Grade Standard Sign Sft 100 150 250 $10.00 1,000.00 1,500.00 2,500.00 $10.50 1,050.00 1,575.00 2,625.00

Aluminum Diamond Grade Special Sign Sft 0 360 360 $13.15 0.00 4,734.00 4,734.00 $12.25 0.00 4,410.00 4,410.00

Street Name Sign (Extruded) Sft 450 840 1,290 $22.00 9,900.00 18,480.00 28,380.00 $16.75 7,537.50 14,070.00 21,607.50

Street Name Sign Bracket Ea 200 550 750 $16.50 3,300.00 9,075.00 12,375.00 $14.75 2,950.00 8,112.50 11,062.50

Sign Post Reflective Sheeting Ft 500 4,290 4,790 $2.50 1,250.00 10,725.00 11,975.00 $10.50 5,250.00 45,045.00 50,295.00

Break Away System Ea 0 630 630 $7.25 0.00 4,567.50 4,567.50 $16.25 0.00 10,237.50 10,237.50

Subtotal - Materials: $118,837.50 $176,744.50 $295,582.00 $145,025.00 $241,067.50 $386,092.50

Mobilization

Urgent - Center Ea 50 5 55 $125.00 6,250.00 625.00 6,875.00 $950.00 47,500.00 4,750.00 52,250.00

Urgent - Outer Ea 0 5 5 $155.00 0.00 775.00 775.00 $950.00 0.00 4,750.00 4,750.00

High Priority - Center Ea 50 5 55 $67.50 3,375.00 337.50 3,712.50 $950.00 47,500.00 4,750.00 52,250.00

High Priority - Outer Ea 0 5 5 $90.00 0.00 450.00 450.00 $950.00 0.00 4,750.00 4,750.00

Normal - Center Ea 1,500 240 1,740 $50.00 75,000.00 12,000.00 87,000.00 $230.00 345,000.00 55,200.00 400,200.00

Normal - Outer Ea 0 300 300 $72.50 0.00 21,750.00 21,750.00 $230.00 0.00 69,000.00 69,000.00

Subtotal - Mobilization: $84,625.00 $35,937.50 $120,562.50 $440,000.00 $143,200.00 $583,200.00

TOTAL: $268,282.50 $460,485.50 $728,768.00 TOTAL: $837,525.00 $892,282.50 $1,729,807.50

Estimated Units Rathco Safety Supply Inc. J. Ranck Electric Inc.

Install Support Ea
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