Bid #:

Bid Item:

Bid Opening Date:
Bid Award Date:
Contract Term:

2026-02

Aggregate Materials - Seasonal

Tuesday, February 10, 2026 at 10:00 am
Tuesday, February 24, 2026
Prices to remain firm through 02/28/2027 with

the option of three (3) - one (1) year extensions

Aggregate Verplank Top Grade | SWARTHOUT Michigan NRK
Resources Inc| Trucking Aggregates, | EXCAVATING | Paving and | Contracting
Companyv LLC. LLC Materials
Item | Quantity Price Price Price Price Price Price
Bid Proposal | Item List | Loaded Price RCKC Truck
at Vendor Location
6A Washed Stone - Ton 1.00 $21.15 No Bid $26.00 $18.00 No Bid No Bid
4724 Ravine 1100 Nazareth | 1285 Mendon
Material Address Rd., Rd., Road, Athens
Kalamazoo Ml Kalamazoo Ml Mi
9A Washed Stone - Ton 1.00 $25.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
8964 Paw Paw
Material Address Lk Dr.,
Kalamazoo mi
21AA Stabilized Gravel - Ton 1.00 $23.40 No Bid No Bid $20.00 $25.25 No Bid
4724 Ravine 1285 Mendon 3700
Material Address Rd., Road, Athens [Patterson Rd.,
Kalamazoo Ml Mi Middleville Mi
22A Stabilized Gravel - Ton 1.00 $10.65 No Bid No Bid $11.00 $9.45 No Bid
4724 Ravine 1285 Mendon 8240 Miller
Material Address Rd., Road, Athens
Rd., Delton MI
Kalamazoo Ml Mi
23A Stabilized Gravel - Ton 1.00 $13.85 No Bid No Bid No Bid $8.90 No Bid
4725 Ravine .
Material Address Rd., 8240 Miller
Rd., Delton MI
Kalamazoo Ml
22A Limestone Gravel - Ton 1.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
23A Limestone Gravel - Ton 1.00 $27.35 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
2425 Kings
Material Address Hwy.,
Kalamazoo Ml
21AA Crushed Concrete - Ton 1.00 $17.00 No Bid $19.00 $20.00 No Bid No Bid
15830 E 1100 Nazareth | 1285 Mendon
Material Address Michigan Ave., Rd., Road, Athens
Kalamazoo MI Kalamazoo Ml Mi
22A Crushed Concrete - Ton 1.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
2’- 3” Stone - Ton 1.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $32.00 No Bid
1700 Frontage
. Rd. SW,
Material Address Grand Rapids
MI
3"- 5" Stone - Ton 1.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
6" - 8 “ Stone - Ton 1.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
9” and larger Stone - Ton 1.00 $47.70 No Bid No Bid $80.00 No Bid No Bid
15830 E 1285 Mendon
Material Address Michigan Ave., Road, Athens
Kalamazoo MI Mi
Ohio #9 Limestone - washed - Ton 1.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $37.75 No Bid
1700 Frontage
. Rd. SW,
Material Address Grand Rapids
MI
H1 Limestone — washed - Ton 1.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
3"-5” Limestone - Ton 1.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
6”-8” Limestone - Ton 1.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $50.00 No Bid




1700 Frontage

. Rd. SW,
Material Address Grand Rapids
MI
9” and larger Limestone - Ton 1.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Concrete Rip/Rap - Ton 1.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Limestone Rip/Rap - Ton 1.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Type Il Unwashed Sand - Ton 1.00 $5.00 No Bid $5.00 $4.00 No Bid No Bid
4725 Ravine 1100 Nazareth | 1285 Mendon
Material Address Rd., Rd., Road, Athens
Kalamazoo Ml Kalamazoo Ml Ml
Asphalt Millings - Ton 1.00 No Bid $14.00 $20.00 $20.00 No Bid
1100 Nazareth | 1285 Mendon 3700
Material Address No Bid No Bid Rd., Road, Athens [Patterson Rd.,
Kalamazoo Ml Ml Middleville Ml
Processed Topsoil - Ton 1.00 $22.45 No Bid $16.00 $18.00 No Bid No Bid
2425 Kings 1100 Nazareth | 1285 Mendon
Material Address Hwy., Rd., Road, Athens
Kalamazoo Ml Kalamazoo Ml Ml
Unprocessed Topsoil - Ton 1.00 $18.75 No Bid $13.00 $10.00 No Bid No Bid
2425 Kings 1100 Nazareth | 1285 Mendon
Material Address Hwy., Rd., Road, Athens
Kalamazoo Ml Kalamazoo Ml Ml
9A Aggregate - Ton 1.00 $25.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
8964 Paw Paw
Material Address Lk Dr.,
Kalamazoo MI
Birds Eye Gravel - Ton 1.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Bid Proposal | Item List | Delivered to RCKC Facility
@ 4400 S 26th Street, Kalamazoo, MI 49048
9A Washed Stone - Ton 1.00 $30.44 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
22A Stabilized Gravel - Ton 1.00 $14.19 No Bid No Bid $18.20 $15.20 No Bid
2’- 3" Stone - Ton 1.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
3"- 5" Stone - Ton 1.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
6" - 8 “ Stone - Ton 1.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
9” and larger Stone - Ton 1.00 $82.00 No Bid No Bid $87.20 No Bid $105.00
H1 Limestone — washed - Ton 1.00 No Bid $39.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
3"-5" Limestone - Ton 1.00 No Bid $75.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
6"-8” Limestone - Ton 1.00 No Bid $75.00 No Bid No Bid $59.75 No Bid
Concrete Rip/Rap - Ton 1.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Type Il Unwashed Sand - Ton 1.00 $8.54 No Bid No Bid $11.20 No Bid $9.50
9A Aggregate - Ton 1.00 $30.44 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Birds Eye Gravel - Ton 1.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid




EST. 1909

Bid Open

Bid #:

Bid Item:

ing Date:

Bid Award Date:

Contract Term:

2026-03

Traffic Signal Communications &
Mast Arm Installation

Tuesday, February 24 at
10:00 a.m.

Tuesday, March 10, 2026

Project

Item Quantity Price Extension

9th Street at Stadium Drive
Mast Arm, Std, Rem - Ea 1.00 $1.00 $1.00
Fdn, Rem - Ea 1.00 $5,800.00f $5,800.00
TS, Temp, Rem - Ea 1.00 $2,200.00f $2,200.00
Mast Arm Pole, Cat Il - Ea 1.00 $17,340.00] $17,340.00
Mast Arm Pole Fdn, 6 Bolt - Ft 11.00 $995.00| $10,945.00
Casing - Ft 11.00 $309.00f $3,399.00
Mast Arm, 50 foot Cat Il - Ea 1.00 $28,000.00] $28,000.00
Modular Video Detection System - Ea 1.00 $56,000.00] $56,000.00
Universal Camera Bracket and Extension - Ea 1.00 $900.00 $900.00
Street name Sign, Two Way, llluminated, 6 Foot - 1.00 $3,794.00( $3,794.00
Ea
Conduit, DB, 3, 3 inch - Ft 12.00 $40.00 $480.00
Conduit, DB, 1, 1 %2 inch - Ft 12.00 $20.00 $240.00
Push Button Station and Sign, Modified - Ea 8.00 $1,350.00f $10,800.00
Pedestrian Signal System, Accessible, Modified - 1.00 $5,168.00f $5,168.00
Ea
TS Uninterruptible Power System - Ea 1.00 $8,950.00f $8,950.00
Wireless Intercn, Ethernet, Access Point - Ea 2.00 $5,175.00f $10,350.00
Wireless Intercn, Ethernet, Remote - Ea 1.00 $5,243.00f $5,243.00
TS, One Way Mast Arm Mtd, FYA (LED) - Ea 1.00 $1,821.00[ $1,821.00
TS, One Way Mast Arm Mtd (LED) - Ea 2.00 $898.00] $1,796.00
TS, Pedestrian, Two Way Bracket Arm Mtd (LED) 1.00 $2,115.00f $2,115.00
Countdown - Ea

TOTAL $175,342.00
Sprinkle Road at N Avenue
TS, Temp. - Lsum 1.00 $7,500.00f $7,500.00
Hh, Rem - Ea 1.00 $80.00 $80.00
Hh, Round - Ea 1.00 $1,960.00f $1,960.00
Fdn, Rem - Ea 1.00 $5,100.00[ $5,100.00
Conduit, Rem - Ft 10.00 $0.10 $1.00
TS, One Way Bracket Arm Mtd, 5 Section (LED), 1.00 $115.00 $115.00
Rem - Ea
Conduit, DB, 3, 3inch - Ft 25.00 $40.00[ $1,000.00
Conduit, DB, 1, 1 % inch - Ft 25.00 $20.00 $500.00




Mast Arm Pole Fdn, 4 Bolt - Ft 12.00 $960.00] $11,520.00
Casing - Ft 12.00 $309.00] $3,708.00
Mast Arm Std, Salv - Ea 1.00 $5,500.00 $5,500.00
TOTAL $36,984.00

Totals $212,326.00




Bid #

Bid ltem

Bid Opening Date
Bid Award Date

Contract Term

: 2026-04

: Asphalt Emulsion Materials

: Tuesday, March 10, 2026 at 10:00am

: Tuesday, March 24, 2026

. Prices to remain firm through December 31, 2026
Option to extended for three (3) one (1) year terms

Michigan ASPHALT Bit-Mat
Paving & MATERIALS, Products of
Materials Co. INC. Michigan, Inc.

Item Quantity Price Price Price
Asphalt Emulsions Materials - Minimum loads will be 5,500 Gallons
CRS-2M 900,000 $2.46 $2.05 2.35
HFRS-2 - Gallon 20,000 No Bid $2.45 2.20
CSS-1H Diluted .
|(Rapid Set Cationic Fog Seal) - Gallon 250,000 $1.39 $1.39 oI
Emulsified Asphalt .
(Dust Control) - Gallon 20,000 No Bid $1.89 $2.02
Chiplock C - Gallon 1 No Bid No Bid $1.78
Other - Gallon 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Asphalt Emulsions Materials - Nonstandard Shipment - Less than
5,500 Gallons
CRS-2M
(Cationic Emulsion) - Gallon ! $2.66000 bz e $2.65100
HFRS-2 - Gallon 1 No Bid $2.70000 $2.50100
CSS-1H Diluted .
|(Rapid Set Cationic Fog Seal) - Gallon ! $1.59000 $1.64000 O
Emulsified Asphalt .
(Dust Control) - Gallon 1 No Bid $2.14000 $2.32100
Chiplock C - Gallon 1 No Bid No Bid $2.08100
Other - Gallon 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Material Restocking Fees (If Applicable)
Returned Material - CRS-2M - Gallon 1 $2.25000 $2.29700 $2.19000
Return Freight - CRS-2M - Gallon 1 $0.32000 $0.12000 $0.08000
Returned Material - HFRS-2 - Gallon 1 No Bid $2.70000 $2.04000
Return Freight - HFRS-2 - Galloon 1 No Bid $0.12000 $0.08000
Returned Material - CSS-1H Diluted - Gallon 1 $1.20000 $1.64000 No Bid
Return Freight - CSS-1H Diluted - Gallon 1 $0.32000 $0.12000 No Bid
Returned Material - Emulsified Asphalt Dust Control - Gallon 1 No Bid $2.14000 No Bid
Return Freight - Emulsified Asphalt Dust Control - Gallon 1 No Bid $0.12000 No Bid
Returned Material - Chiplock C - Gallon 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Return Freight - Chiplock C - Gallon 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Returned Material - Other - Gallon 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Return Freight - Other - Gallon 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Demurrage
Demurrage Truck/Tanker - Hour 1.00 $110.00 $150.00 $110.00
Maximum unloading time once the truck is on-site before demurrage

) 1.00 3 2 2

applies. - Hour




Bid Number: 2026-05
Bid Item: Crack Fill - Various Locations
Bid Opening Date: Tuesday, March 31, 2026
Bid Award Date: April 7, 2026
Contract Terms: Prices to remain firm through 12/31/2026, with the option to extend for
three (3) one (1) year extensions by mutual

Asphalt Restoration Inc. Thompson Construction Company Scodeller Construction Inc
Item
Quantity Price Extension | Quantity Price Extension | Quantity Price Extension
ROAD PROJECTS (June 1, 2026 completion date)
Charleston - L Avenue - 2'800' west of 40th Street to .
1'900' west of 40th Street - 0.17 - Pounc No Bid 340.00 $2.31 $785.40 500.00 $2.00 $1,000.00
Charleston -Climax Drive - Streamside Drive to 1100 No Bid 420.00 $2.31 $970.20 500.00 $2.00 $1,000.00

west of Streamside Drive - 0.21 - Pound

Cooper - E Avenue — 5,280 west of Riverview Drive to
23rd Street

23rd Street — E Avenue to DE Avenue No Bid 5,080.00 $2.31 $11,734.80 | 5,000.00 $1.65 $8,250.00
DE Avenue — 23rd Street to Sprinkle Road - 2.54 - Pound

Cooper - B Avenue - Riverview Drive to 24th Street -

el No Bid 3,02000 | $231 | $6,976.20 | 450000 | $1.65 | $7,425.00
f‘;g'f‘g‘l&zc Avenue - M-43 to West Gull Lake Drive - No Bid 310000 | $231 | $7,161.00 | 500000 | $1.65 | $8,250.00
Richland - C Avenue - 28th Street to M-89 - 0.65 - Pound No Bid 1,300.00 $2.31 $3,003.00 1,500.00 $2.00 $3,000.00
Eﬂﬁnd - 28th Street - D Avenue to C Avenue - 1.02 - No Bid 2,040.00 | $231 | $4,71240 | 3550000 | $1.65 | $5,775.00
Richland - 24th Street - G Avenue to 7,708" north of G No Bid 2,500.00 | $231 | $5775.00 | 4550000 | $1.65 | $7,425.00
Avenue - 1.25 - Pounc

Eﬂﬁnd - F Avenue - 27th Street fo 28th Street - 0.52 - No Bid 1,040.00 | $231 | $2.402.40 | 1,000.00 | $200 | $2,000.00
Richland - DE Avenue - 34th Street to 5,300' east of 34th .

oand - DE Aven No Bid 2,000.00 | $231 | $4,620.00 | 400000 | $1.65 | $6,600.00
Alamo - Country View Drive - 8th Street to 1,400, east of .

o County View No Bid 54000 | $231 | $1,247.40 | 50000 | $2.00 | $1,000.00
Alamo - E Avenue - 1,900' west of 12th Street to 12th .

e e | No Bid 72000 | $231 | $1,66320 | 800.00 | $2.00 | $1,600.00
Comstock - M Avenue - 33rd Street to 35th Street - 0.75 - No Bid 1,500.00 $2.31 $3.465.00 2,500.00 $1.65 $4,125.00

Pound

Comstock - Leenhouts Street- East Michigan Avenue to
2,220’ north of East Michigan AvenueKincaid Street -
Josephine Street to 1,320 north of Josephine
StreetElectra Street - Kincaid Street to Shields
Street,Shields Street - Josephine Street to Charles
AvenueCross Street - Collette Avenue to Shields
Street,Benedict Avenue - Cross Street to 1,650' north of
Cross Street,Collette Avenue - Josephine Street to 1,320
north of Electra StreetJosephine Street - Leenhouts No Bid 8,580.00 $2.31 $19,819.80 | 16,000.00 | $1.65 $26,400.00
Street to 206" east of Shields StreetDaniel Street -
Electra Street to Charlles Avenue,Charles Avenue -
Daniel Street to Shields Street,Neal Street- Shields
Street to 26th StreetRex Avenue- E. Michigan Avenue to
Charles AvenueBarker Avenue- Rex Avenue to Pickard
StreetCharles Avenue- Rex Avenue to Pickard
StreetPickard Street- E. Michigan Avenue to Charles
Avenue" - 4 29 - Pol

ind
Comstock - H Avenue - 28th Street to 30th Street - 1.0 -

Pound No Bid 2,000.00 $2.31 $4,620.00 | 3,000.00 $1.65 $4,950.00

Comstock - ML Avenue - 35th Street to 36th Street - 0.78

No Bid 1,560.00 $2.31 $3,603.60 | 2,500.00 $1.65 $4,125.00
- Pound




Kalamazoo - Turwill Lane — 1002’ south of west Main
Street to Ottawa AvenuePontiac Avenue — 660’ west of
Seminole to 660’ east of SeminoleOttawa Avenue — 661’
west of Seminole to 660’ east of SeminoleAlamo Avenue
— Turwill Lane to Cherokee Streetlroquois Trail — 165’
west of Turwill Lane to Nichols RoadHuron Avenue —
Turwill Lane to Nichols RoadMarlane Avenue — Mohawk
Street to Nichols RoadCroyden Avenue — 198’ west of
Turwill Lane to Nichols RoadCranbrook Avenue —
Cherokee Street to Croyden AvenueDevonshire Avenue
— 198’ west of Turwill Lane to Nichols RoadCanterbury
Avenue — 198’ west of Turwill Lane to Nichols
RoadGrace Road — Gorham Lane to Nichols RoadOlney
Road — Gorham Lane to Nichols RoadSeminole Street —
Croyden Avenue to Grand Prairie RoadGorham Lane —
West Main Street to Devonshire AvenueCherokee Street
— West Main Street to Alamo AvenueMohawk Street —
Olney Road to 440’ north of Iroquois Trail - 7.82 - Pound

No Bid

15,640.00

$2.31

$36,128.40

32,000.00

$1.65

$52,800.00

Kalamazoo - Turwill Lane — 1002’ south of west Main
Street to Ottawa AvenuePontiac Avenue — 660’ west of
Seminole to 660’ east of SeminoleOttawa Avenue — 661’
west of Seminole to 660’ east of SeminoleAlamo Avenue
— Turwill Lane to Cherokee Streetlroquois Trail — 165’
west of Turwill Lane to Nichols RoadHuron Avenue —
Turwill Lane to Nichols RoadMarlane Avenue — Mohawk
Street to Nichols RoadCroyden Avenue — 198’ west of
Turwill Lane to Nichols RoadCranbrook Avenue —
Cherokee Street to Croyden AvenueDevonshire Avenue
— 198’ west of Turwill Lane to Nichols RoadCanterbury
Avenue — 198’ west of Turwill Lane to Nichols
RoadGrace Road — Gorham Lane to Nichols RoadOlney
Road — Gorham Lane to Nichols RoadSeminole Street —
Croyden Avenue to Grand Prairie RoadGorham Lane —
West Main Street to Devonshire AvenueCherokee Street
— West Main Street to Alamo AvenueMohawk Street —
Olney Road to 440’ north of Iroquois Trail - 1.39 - Pound

No Bid

2,780.00

$2.31

$6,421.80

5,000.00

$1.65

$8,250.00

Oshtemo - 1st Street - Almena Drive to M-43 - 1.06 -
Pound

No Bid

2,120.00

$2.31

$4,897.20

3,500.00

$1.65

$5,775.00

Oshtemo - Big Rock Drive - M-43 to M-43 - 0.72 - Pound

No Bid

1,440.00

$2.31

$3,326.40

3,500.00

$1.65

$5,775.00

Oshtemo - 3rd Street - Big Rock Drive to G Avenue -
2.42 - Pound

No Bid

4,840.00

$2.31

$11,180.40

9,500.00

$1.65

$15,675.00

Ross - 44th Street - C Avenue to Baseline Road - 2.05 -
Pound

No Bid

4,100.00

$2.31

$9,471.00

7,000.00

$1.65

$11,550.00

Ross - 46th Street - Augusta Drive to M-89 - 1.34 - Pound

No Bid

2,680.00

$2.31

$6,190.80

4,500.00

$1.65

$7,425.00

Ross - D Avenue - 39th Street to 40th Street - 0.47 -
Pound

No Bid

940.00

$2.31

$2,171.40

800.00

$2.00

$1,600.00

Ross - B Avenue - 45th Street to 48th Street - 1.61 -
Pound

No Bid

3,220.00

$2.31

$7,438.20

6,000.00

$1.65

$9,900.00

Climax/Charleston - 42nd Street - O Avenue to MN
Avenue - 1.5 - Pound

No Bid

3,000.00

$2.31

$6,930.00

5,000.00

$1.65

$8,250.00

Alamo - G Avenue - 6th Street to 10th Street - 2.0 -
Pound

No Bid

4,000.00

$2.31

$9,240.00

7,500.00

$1.65

$12,375.00

Comstock - 28th Street - MN Avenue to ML Avenue - 1.0
- Pound

No Bid

2,000.00

$2.31

$4,620.00

4,000.00

$1.65

$6,600.00

Comstock - 29th Street - N Avenue to MN Avenue - 0.5 -
Pound

No Bid

1,000.00

$2.31

$2,310.00

3,000.00

$1.65

$4,950.00

Comstock - Miller Service Drive - 35th Street to Miller
Drive - 0.1 - Pound

No Bid

200.00

$2.31

$462.00

500.00

$2.00

$1,000.00

Comstock - ML Avenue - Sprinkle Road to 26th Street -
1.2 - Pound

No Bid

2,400.00

$2.31

$5,544.00

4,500.00

$1.65

$7,425.00

MN Avenue - 28th Street to 29th Street - 0.5 - Pound

No Bid

1,000.00

$2.31

$2,310.00

800.00

$2.00

$1,600.00

Comstock - Sprinkle Road - 1-94 Business Loop to East
Michigan Avenue - 1.0 - Pounc

No Bid

2,000.00

$2.31

$4,620.00

4,500.00

$1.65

$7,425.00

Kalamazoo - Douglas Avenue - 2,650' south of Mosel
Avenue to Mosel Avenue - 0.5 - Pounc

No Bid

1,000.00

$2.31

$2,310.00

800.00

$2.00

$1,600.00

Kalamazoo - Drake Road - 300' south of Squires Drive
to Ravine Road - 0.5 - Pound

No Bid

1,000.00

$2.31

$2,310.00

800.00

$2.00

$1,600.00

Kalamazoo - Nichols Road - Ravine Road to Barney
Road - 0.3 - Pound

No Bid

600.00

$2.31

$1,386.00

800.00

$2.00

$1,600.00

Oshtemo - 10th Street - West Main Street to H Avenue -
1.5 - Pound

No Bid

3,000.00

$2.31

$6,930.00

5,000.00

$1.65

$8,250.00

Oshtemo - 4th Street - Stadium Drive to West Main
Street - 3.2 - Pound

No Bid

6,400.00

$2.31

$14,784.00

12,000.00

$1.65

$19,800.00

Oshtemo - 9th Street - N Avenue to Stadium Drive - 1.0 -
Pound

No Bid

2,000.00

$2.31

$4,620.00

4,500.00

$1.65

$7,425.00




Oshtemo - 9th Street Stadium Drive to KL Avenue - 1.8 -

Oshte No Bid 3,600.00 | $231 | $8,316.00 | 7,00000 | $1.65 | $11,550.00

Oshtemo - 3th Street - West Main Stret to i Avenue - No Bid 300000 | $231 | $6930.00 | 6,000.00 | $1.65 | $9,900.00

SES;Z‘“" - Stadium Drive - 4th Street to 6th Street - 1.0 - No Bid 2,000.00 | $231 | $4620.00 | 450000 | $1.65 | $7,425.00

%Z’Ltﬁ;m - Stadium Drive - 8th Street to 9th Street - 0.6 - No Bid 1,20000 | $231 | $2772.00 | 2,000.00 | $1.65 | $3,300.00

Ross - 37th Street - G Avenue to D Avenue - 2.7 - Pound No Bid 540000 | $2.31 | $12,474.00 | 850000 | $1.65 | $14,025.00

Ross  Fort Custer Drive - M-96 10 13,464' east of M-96 - No Bid 480000 | $231 | $11,088.00 | 850000 | $165 | $14,025.00
TOTALS FOR JUNE 1, 202¢| $284,361.00 $361,800.00

ROAD PROJECTS (July 1, 2026 completion date)

Frayie Ronde - XY Avenue - 6ih Streetto 8th Street - | 440000 | 134 | $5896.00 | 242000 | $219 | $5299.80 | 450000 | $165 | $7.42500

fraine Ronde -V Avenue - Van Kal Streetto 2nd Street-| 570000 | $1.34 | $7,638.00 | 200000 | $219 | $4,38000 | 350000 | $165 | $577500

Prairie Ronde - th Street - U Avenue to Paw Paw Lake | 5 70509 | g134 | $3618.00 | 2,00000 | $2.19 | $4,380.00 | 4,00000 | $1.65 | $6,600.00

Drive - 1.0 - Pound

Prairie Ronde - Paw Paw Heights Drive — 2nd Street to

Beech Bay Drive

Beech Bay Drive — Paw Paw heights Drive to 673" eastof| 5 15909 | 3134 | $2814.00 | 1,00000 | $2.19 | $2,19000 | 80000 | $200 | $1,600.00

Paw Paw Heights Drive

Rainbow Ridge Drive — Paw Paw Heights Drive to 770’

east of Paw Paw Heights Drive - 0.5 - Pounc

Schoolcraft - Oakland Drive - U Avenue 0 5,350'north of | 6 455 09 | §1.34 | $8576.00 | 2,100.00 | $2.19 | $4,599.00 | 450000 | $1.65 | $7,425.00

U Avenue - 1.05 - Pound

Schoolcraft - Green Prairie Street - 1,334 south of VW

e e T Sireet - 1. 1,000.00 | $1.34 | $1,32000 | 50000 | $219 | $1,00500 | 50000 | $2.00 | $1,000.00

Schoolcraft - West Tremblay Drive — 1,071’ south of VW

Avenue to VW Avenue

Tremiiny Drive - 1 858! south of VW Avente to VIV 50.00 $1.34 $67.00 | 98000 | $219 | $2,146.20 | 800.00 | $200 | $1,600.00

Avenue - 0.49 - Pounc

Texas - R Avenue - 8th Street to 12th Street - 2.0 - Pound 15 500 09 | §1.34 | $16,080.00 | 4,00000 | $219 | $8.760.00 | 7,00000 | $1.65 | $11,550.00

Texas - R Avenue - 6th Street to 8th Street - 1.25 - Poundt 3700 09 | §134 | $4958.00 | 2,500.00 | $2.19 | $5475.00 | 450000 | $1.65 | $7,425.00

;2’;‘;2 R Avenue - Vankal Street to 6th Street-2.77- | 550000 | 134 | $6,700.00 | 554000 | $219 | $12.132.60 | 11,00000| $1.65 | $18,150.00

;2’;‘;2 RS Avenue - Vankal Street to 2nd Street- 1.25- | 510000 | 134 | $6,834.00 | 250000 | $2.19 | $5.475.00 | 450000 | $1.65 | $7.425.00

qoxas_2nd Street - Paw Paw Lake Drive to S Avenue - | 570000 | $134 | $361800 | 170000 | $219 | $372300 | 400000 | $165 | $6600.00

Texas - Crooked Lake Drive West - Q Avenue to PQ 3,00000 | $1.34 | $4,020.00 | 1,160.00 | $219 | $2.54040 | 3,00000 | $1.65 | $4,950.00

Avenue - 0.58 - Pounc

Texas - Pennycress Lane — P Avenue to 1st Street

Chicory Trail - Pennycress Lane to 1st Street - 1.35 - 10,200.00 $1.34 $13,668.00 | 2,700.00 $2.19 $5,913.00 | 4,500.00 $1.65 $7,425.00

Pound

Texas - O Avenue - 4th Street to 6th Street - 1.05-Pound 50 09 | g134 | $3350.00 | 210000 | $2.19 | $4,599.00 | 400000 | $1.65 | $6,600.00

Texas - O Avenue - 2,820' west of 1st Street to 1,400’

Lo o arenue 220 et 11,600.00 | $1.34 | $15544.00 | 4,460.00 | $2.19 | $9,767.40 | 9,500.00 | $1.65 | $15,675.00

gz’j‘a_s F‘,Ejﬁf Lake Drive - OP Avenue to OP Avenue - | 510000 | $1.34 | $4,154.00 | 1,08000 | $2.19 | $236520 | 2,00000 | $165 | $3,300.00

FB,ZEU%' 28th Street - W Avenue to V Avenue - 1.0 - 6,000.00 | $1.34 | $8,040.00 | 2,00000 | $2.19 | $4,380.00 | 4,000.00 | $1.65 | $6,600.00

FB,ZEU%' 33rd Street - X Avenue fo W Avenue - 1.0 - 5500.00 | $1.34 | $7,370.00 | 2,000.00 | $2.19 | $4,380.00 | 4,500.00 | $1.65 | $7,425.00

FB,ZEU%' 26th Street - UV Avenue to TU Avenue -0.75- | 395000 | $134 | $5226.00 | 1,500.00 | $2.19 | $3.285.00 | 4,000.00 | $1.65 | $6,600.00

FB,ZEU%' 26th Street - TU Avenue fo T Avenue - 0.5 - 240000 | $1.34 | $3216.00 | 1,00000 | $2.19 | $2,190.00 | 1,500.00 | $1.65 | $2,475.00

ggz”:: - S Avenue - 36th Street to 39th Street - 1.5 - 500000 | $1.34 | $6,700.00 | 300000 | $2.19 | $6,570.00 | 4,500.00 | $1.65 | $7.425.00

Climax -P Avenue — 44th Street to 45th Street

s o e e e e 460000 | $1.34 | $6,164.00 | 300000 | $2.19 | $6,570.00 | 500000 | $1.65 | $8.250.00

Climax - QR Avenue — 36th Street to Woodin Street

Jamieson Street - 36th Street to Woodin Street

Norscot Street — 36th Street to Woodin Street

Woodin Street — QR Avenue to QR Avenue 14,500.00 $1.34 $19,430.00 | 3,000.00 $2.19 $6,570.00 | 4,500.00 $1.65 $7,425.00

Watson Street — QR Avenue to Norscot Street

Erick Road — QR Avenue to Norscot Street - 1.5 - Pound

Climax - QR Avenue - 4,400' west of 38th Street to 38th

imax - AR Avenue 580000 | $1.34 | $7,772.00 | 1,660.00 | $2.19 | $3.635.40 | 3,000.00 | $1.65 | $4,950.00

ﬁgn‘:g” - 33rd Street - R Avenue to Q Avenue - 1.0 - 6,000.00 | $1.34 | $8,040.00 | 2,000.00 | $2.19 | $4,380.00 | 4,500.00 | $1.65 | $7,425.00

ﬁgn‘:g” - R Avenue - 33rd Street to 36th Street - 1.5 | ) 76000 | ¢134 | $6.208.00 | 300000 | $2.19 | $6,570.00 | 6,00000 | $1.65 | $9,900.00

Pavilion - TS Avenue - 33rd Street to 34th Street - 0.8 | 4 3009 | g1.34 | $6432.00 | 1,60000 | $2.19 | $3504.00 | 300000 | $1.65 | $4,950.00

Pound




Schoolcraft - U Avenue - Portage Road to 275' south of

Soneoloralt -1 dvenue - 30.00 $1.34 $4020 | 3,800.00 | $219 | $832200 | 7,00000 | $1.65 | $11,550.00
Schoolcraft - VW Avenue - 18th Street - 5,544' east of
bortade Rod . 1.6 - bound 9,200.00 | $1.34 | $12,328.00 | 360000 | $2.19 | $7.884.00 | 7,000.00 | $1.65 | $11,550.00
Texas - 11th Street/ ON Avenue - 12th Street to N
oxas - 110 Steet ¢ 1,70000 | $1.34 | $2,278.00 | 1,600.00 | $219 | $3,504.00 | 350000 | $1.65 | $5,775.00
Texas - 3rd Street - Q Avenue to P Avenue - 1.0-Pound | 4 50 09 | g134 | $2,01000 | 2,00000 | $2.19 | $4,380.00 | 450000 | $1.65 | $7.425.00
;zﬁiz Sth Street - Q Avenue to PQ Avenue - 0.5 - 450.00 | $1.34 $603.00 | 1,00000 | $219 | $2,190.00 | 3,00000 | $1.65 | $4,950.00
gzﬁiz PQ Avenus - 5th Strest to 6th Street - 0.5 - 50.00 $1.34 $67.00 | 1,00000 | $219 | $2,100.00 | 1,500.00 | $1.65 | $2,475.00
gzﬁiz S Avenue - Vankal Street fo 8th Street - 4.0 4390000 | 134 | $25326.00 | 800000 | $2.19 | $17,520.00 | 15.000.00 | 165 | $24.750.00
E,;i%‘ 27th Street - YZ Avenue fo Y Avenue - 0.5 - 1,050.00 | $1.34 | $1,407.00 | 1,00000 | $219 | $2,190.00 | 2,00000 | $1.65 | $3,300.00
Brady - 28th Street - 2,640' south of YZ Avenue to YZ
rady - 281 Stree - 54000 | $1.34 | $72360 | 1,00000 | $219 | $2,190.00 | 150000 | $1.65 | $2.475.00
E,;i%‘ 29th Street - W Avenue to U Avenue - 2.1 - 12,600.00 | $1.34 | $16,884.00 | 4,200.00 | $2.19 | $9,198.00 | 7,500.00 | $1.65 | $12,375.00
E,;i%‘ YZ Avenue - 27th Street fo 32nd Street-26 - | 76000 | 134 | $6,208.00 | 520000 | $2.19 | $11,388.00 | 9.000.00 | 165 | $14.850.00
ggz”:: - 36th Street - T Avenue to PQ Avenus - 3.5 - 460000 | $1.34 | $6,164.00 | 7,000.00 | $2.19 | $15,330.00 | 12,000.00| $1.65 | $19,800.00
Climax - ON Avenue - 3,960' west of 47th Street to
5 900" cnot ot A7t Stront 18 Poan 3,600.00 | $1.34 | $4,824.00 | 300000 | $2.19 | $6,570.00 | 6,500.00 | $1.65 | $10,725.00
ﬁgn‘:g” - QAvenue - 34th Street to 36th Street - 1.0 | 555000 | g134 | $4.824.00 | 200000 | $2.19 | $4,380.00 | 450000 | s$165 | $7.425.00
ﬁgn‘:g” - R Avenue - 24th Street to 25th Street - 1.1~ | 35000 | g134 | $5762.00 | 220000 | $2.19 | sa818.00 | 450000 | $165 | $7,425.00
ﬁgn‘:g” - S Avenue - Sprinkle Road to 20th Street-2.6 - | 7 450 00 | g1.34 | $10452.00 | 520000 | $2.19 | $11,388.00 | 850000 | 165 | $14,025.00
Wakeshma - W Avenue - 670' east of 42nd Street to
2 A e ot A7th St <29 o 13,600.00 | $1.34 | $18,224.00 | 5800.00 | $2.19 | $12,702.00 | 9,000.00 | $1.65 | $14,850.00
Vgizizhma - Y Avenue - 42nd Street to 48th Street - 3.0 4 143 550 00 | §1.34 | $18,090.00 | 6,00000 | $2.19 | $13,140.00 | 11,00000| $1.65 | $18,150.00
TOTAL FOR JULY 1, 202¢| $329,867.80 $276,159.00 $387.825.00
91 items Totals $329.867.80| Totals $560,520.00] Totals $749.625.00
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